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The most effective way to generate an estimate of a new product's cost, engineering change cost, or
innovation cost is through a detailed cost investigation. Analysis of the available materials and processes
leads to the most economical and financial decisions. Now in its third edition, Realistic Cost Estimating for
Manufacturing has been used by students and practitioners since 1968 in this endeavor. Revised and
expanded, the book recognizes the extremely important role estimating is playing in today's highly
competitive global economy.

Realistic Cost Estimating for Manufacturing provides a survey of the myriad manufacturing processes and
practices and combines this with in-depth explanations and examples of costing methods and tools. A
comprehensive, standardized approach to their application is given. Among the manufacturing processes
surveyed are: machining, casting, stamping, forging, welding, plastics technology, finishing, and rapid
prototyping.

To develop realistic baseline estimates, an engineering or costing professional must have an in-depth
understanding of costing methods and techniques. As a fundamental reference, the book provides insight into
the art, science, and functions of cost estimation in a wide range of activities: product design and
manufacturing, engineering change control, proposal development, make or buy studies, identifying cost
reduction opportunities, component costing, reverse engineering, benchmarking, and examining alternative
processes, materials, machines, and tooling. As examples, it will aid the practitioner in efforts to justify the
replacement or improvement of existing technology with new creative solutions; perform a feasibility study;
develop a basis for cost-oriented decision support; improve supply chain evaluation and sourcing analysis;
and minimize costs.

The third edition has been greatly enhanced with new chapters and material dedicated to the roles of
economics and finance, cost reduction, continuous improvement, plastic parts, electronics cost estimating,
costing studies, advanced manufacturing processes, and quality costs. Further, the existing chapters have
been significantly expanded to include new processes and operations and examples to enhance learning.
Since nontraditional technology is widely applied in manufacturing, its costing aspects are also explored.
Five Appendices provide additional information on productivity based on efficiency, cost reduction,
matching part features to manufacturing processes, packaging cost, and inspection and measurement costs.

As with its previous editions, instructors of cost estimating courses can rely on the book to provide a solid
foundation for manufacturing engineering courses and programs of study. The book is also useful for on-the-
job training courses for engineers, managers, estimators, designers, and practitioners. It can be applied in
seminars and workshops specifically dedicated to product or component cost reduction, alternative cost
analysis, engineering change cost control, or proposal development. There are multiple equations and
calculation examples, as well as end-of-chapter questions to test student's knowledge. An instructor's guide is
also available.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Walker:

Do you one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
this kind of aren't like that. This Realistic Cost Estimating for Manufacturing, 3rd Edition book is readable
through you who hate the straight word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable reading
experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer
associated with Realistic Cost Estimating for Manufacturing, 3rd Edition content conveys prospect easily to
understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different
such as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Realistic Cost Estimating for Manufacturing, 3rd Edition is not
loveable to be your top list reading book?

David Dugas:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you personally is Realistic Cost Estimating for Manufacturing, 3rd Edition this e-book
consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This book was represented how can the
world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer
made some investigation when he makes this book. This is why this book suited all of you.

Steve Pratt:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you might have it
in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This particular Realistic Cost Estimating for Manufacturing,
3rd Edition can give you a lot of good friends because by you looking at this one book you have thing that
they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. That book can be one of a step for you to
get success. This publication offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more
than additional make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? Let me have Realistic Cost Estimating for
Manufacturing, 3rd Edition.

Carolyn Cook:

You may get this Realistic Cost Estimating for Manufacturing, 3rd Edition by go to the bookstore or Mall.
Simply viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties to your knowledge.
Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by simply written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by
e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what their
problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most
important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose suitable ways for



you.
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