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We have always had a tradition in our home of praying and reading the Scriptures each morning with our
children, and having family devotions each evening. We have endeavored to purchase and use as much good
children s material as possible, in order to train our five dear children in the things of the Lord from the day
they were born. Unfortunately today, many precious lives are being led astray by the evil teaching of
evolution. Young children spend countless hours, in front of a television set, watching humanistic
evolutionary programs. It has been our burden to produce quality books that children and parents can use
together, not only to learn about the Bible and God s word, but also to defend the Christian faith against the
onslaughts of evolutionary ideas that are so pervasive in our society. The Scripture plainly teaches that the
father is to be the spiritual head of the family, and the father to the children shall make know thy truth.
(Isaiah 38:19) We believe this book provides a unique opportunity for parents, and particularly fathers, to
spend time with their children, and teach them the wonderful truths of creation using those fascinating
creatures the dinosaurs. We have tried to make this book entertaining, instructive, and colorful. We wrote it
as a rhyme book, as we have found that most children enjoy learning and reciting rhymes. We hope this will
be a book that parents as well as children will love. It should stimulate family togetherness, and encourage
the reading of books, rather than the watching of television. It is our prayer that this book will cause children
to request more and more: Please, read me a story, Daddy. Ken and Mally Ham
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From reader reviews:

Eric Totten:

Now a day people that Living in the era wherever everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each facts they get. How people have to
be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information specially this D Is for Dinosaur book as this book
offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt
in it you probably know this.

Edward McClung:

The guide with title D Is for Dinosaur contains a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of
advantage after read this book. This book exist new understanding the information that exist in this reserve
represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of
the world. This particular book will bring you with new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book on
your own smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Stephanie Gilley:

Is it you actually who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This D Is for Dinosaur can be the
answer, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of date, spending your time by reading in
this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Fran Short:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got college students? We believe that that
query was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you
know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that reading is
very important and also book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update regarding something by book.
Numerous books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is this D Is for Dinosaur.
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