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In this New York Times hardcover bestseller, Janice Kaplan spends a year living gratefully and
transforms her marriage, family life, work, and health. Her pioneering reseach was praised
in People and Vanity Fair and hailed on TV shows including Today, The O’Reilly Factor, and
CBS’s The Talk. 

On New Year’s Eve, journalist and former Parade editor in chief Janice Kaplan makes a promise to be
grateful and look on the bright side of whatever happens. She realizes that how she feels over the next twelve
months will have less to do with the events that occur than with her own attitude and perspective. Getting
advice at every turn from psychologists, academics, doctors, and philosophers, she brings readers on a smart
and witty journey to discover the value of appreciating what you have.

Relying on both amusing personal experiences and extensive research, Kaplan explores how gratitude can
transform every aspect of life including marriage and friendship, money and ambition, and health and fitness.
She learns how appreciating your spouse changes the neurons of your brain and why saying thanks helps
CEOs succeed. Through extensive interviews with experts and lively conversations with real people,
including celebrities like Matt Damon, Daniel Craig, and Jerry Seinfeld, Kaplan discovers the role of
gratitude in everything from our sense of fulfillment to our children’s happiness. 

With warmth, humor, and appealing insight, Kaplan’s journey will empower readers to think positively and
start living their own best year ever. 

From the hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Alan Dean:

The book The Gratitude Diaries: How a Year Looking on the Bright Side Can Transform Your Life can give
more knowledge and information about everything you want. So why must we leave the great thing like a
book The Gratitude Diaries: How a Year Looking on the Bright Side Can Transform Your Life? A few of
you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim in which book can give many information for us. It
is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for
that, you may give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book The Gratitude Diaries: How a Year
Looking on the Bright Side Can Transform Your Life has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and
massive function for you. You can look the enormous world by available and read a e-book. So it is very
wonderful.

Helen Kingsbury:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the subject The Gratitude
Diaries: How a Year Looking on the Bright Side Can Transform Your Life suitable to you? Often the book
was written by popular writer in this era. Often the book untitled The Gratitude Diaries: How a Year Looking
on the Bright Side Can Transform Your Lifeis the one of several books that will everyone read now. That
book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new
dimensions that you ever know prior to. The author explained their idea in the simple way, and so all of
people can easily to understand the core of this book. This book will give you a great deal of information
about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Vikki Maynard:

Reading a book tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the books. But also they write about
the information about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their
ability in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write for their book. One of them is this The
Gratitude Diaries: How a Year Looking on the Bright Side Can Transform Your Life.

Lily Terry:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from a
book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of news. With this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add



your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
looking for the The Gratitude Diaries: How a Year Looking on the Bright Side Can Transform Your Life
when you desired it?
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